
IT’S YOUR TURN! 
SAUL’S TURN 
1 Samuel 9:15-21,26-27 
 
Now the Lord had told Samuel the previous day, “About this time 
tomorrow I will send you a man from the land of Benjamin. Anoint 
him to be the leader of my people, Israel. He will rescue them from 
the Philistines, for I have looked down on my people in mercy and 
have heard their cry.” When Samuel saw Saul, the Lord said, 
“That’s the man I told you about! He will rule my people.” Just then 
Saul approached Samuel at the gateway and asked, “Can you 
please tell me where the seer’s house is?” “I am the seer!” Samuel 
replied. “Go up to the place of worship ahead of me. We will eat 
there together, and in the morning I’ll tell you what you want to 
know and send you on your way. And don’t worry about those 
donkeys that were lost three days ago, for they have been found. 
And I am here to tell you that you and your family are the focus of 
all Israel’s hopes.” Saul replied, “But I’m only from the tribe of 
Benjamin, the smallest tribe in Israel, and my family is the least 
important of all the families of that tribe! Why are you talking like 
this to me?”…. 26 At daybreak the next morning, Samuel called to 
Saul, “Get up! It’s time you were on your way.” So Saul got ready, 
and he and Samuel left the house together. When they reached 
the edge of town, Samuel told Saul to send his servant on ahead. 
After the servant was gone, Samuel said, “Stay here, for I have 
received a special message for you from God.” 
 
 
1 Samuel 10:1,5-12,17-24 
Then Samuel took a flask of olive oil and poured it over Saul’s 
head. He kissed Saul and said, “I am doing this because the Lord 
has appointed you to be the ruler over Israel, his special 
possession… 5 “When you arrive at Gibeah of God, where the 
garrison of the Philistines is located, you will meet a band of 
prophets coming down from the place of worship. They will be 
playing a harp, a tambourine, a flute, and a lyre, and they will be 
prophesying. At that time the Spirit of the Lord will come 
powerfully upon you, and you will prophesy with them. You will be 
changed into a different person. After these signs take place, do 
what must be done, for God is with you. Then go down to Gilgal 
ahead of me. I will join you there to sacrifice burnt offerings and 

peace offerings. You must wait for seven days until I arrive and 
give you further instructions.” As Saul turned and started to leave, 
God gave him a new heart, and all Samuel’s signs were fulfilled 
that day. When Saul and his servant arrived at Gibeah, they saw a 
group of prophets coming toward them. Then the Spirit of God 
came powerfully upon Saul, and he, too, began to prophesy. 
When those who knew Saul heard about it, they exclaimed, 
“What? Is even Saul a prophet? How did the son of Kish become 
a prophet?” And one of those standing there said, “Can anyone 
become a prophet, no matter who his father is?” So that is the 
origin of the saying “Is even Saul a prophet?” … 17 Later Samuel 
called all the people of Israel to meet before the Lord at Mizpah. 
And he said, “This is what the Lord , the God of Israel, has 
declared: I brought you from Egypt and rescued you from the 
Egyptians and from all of the nations that were oppressing you. 
But though I have rescued you from your misery and distress, you 
have rejected your God today and have said, ‘No, we want a king 
instead!’ Now, therefore, present yourselves before the Lord by 
tribes and clans.” So Samuel brought all the tribes of Israel before 
the Lord , and the tribe of Benjamin was chosen by lot. Then he 
brought each family of the tribe of Benjamin before the Lord , and 
the family of the Matrites was chosen. And finally Saul son of Kish 
was chosen from among them. But when they looked for him, he 
had disappeared! So they asked the Lord , “Where is he?” And the 
Lord replied, “He is hiding among the baggage.” So they found 
him and brought him out, and he stood head and shoulders above 
anyone else. Then Samuel said to all the people, “This is the man 
the Lord has chosen as your king. No one in all Israel is like him!” 
And all the people shouted, “Long live the king!”  
 
1 Samuel 13:13-14 
“How foolish!” Samuel exclaimed. “You have not kept the 
command the Lord your God gave you. Had you kept it, the Lord 
would have established your kingdom over Israel forever. But now 
your kingdom must end, for the Lord has sought out a man after 
his own heart. The Lord has already appointed him to be the 
leader of his people, because you have not kept the Lord ’s 
command.”  
 
 
 



God ___________ Saul to be _________ of ___________.    
 
Then God gave Saul a ______ _________.  A ___________ 
in which he would __________ to ________________. 
 
Even though he was _____________, he always remained 
_______________ in his _____________. 
 
When Samuel introduced Saul to the ___________, he 
________ among the ________________. 
 
This lack of ________________ in God – amongst other 
______________ _______ – prompted God to ___________ 
______ ____ _________. 
 
 
Key Takeaway:  If we _______________ to lack 
_________________ in our calling, God _______ 
____________ to ____________ ______. 
 
 
Pray this week:    
 
 
 
 
NOTES: 
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