
Joseph’s Interpretations Part 2 
 
Genesis 41:1-36 
 
Then it came to pass, at the end of two full years, that Pharaoh had a 
dream; and behold, he stood by the river. Suddenly there came up 
out of the river seven cows, fine looking and fat; and they fed in the 
meadow. Then behold, seven other cows came up after them out of 
the river, ugly and gaunt, and stood by the other cows on the bank of 
the river. And the ugly and gaunt cows ate up the seven fine looking 
and fat cows. So Pharaoh awoke. He slept and dreamed a second 
time; and suddenly seven heads of grain came up on one stalk, 
plump and good. Then behold, seven thin heads, blighted by the east 
wind, sprang up after them. And the seven thin heads devoured the 
seven plump and full heads. So Pharaoh awoke, and indeed, it was a 
dream. Now it came to pass in the morning that his spirit was 
troubled, and he sent and called for all the magicians of Egypt and all 
its wise men. And Pharaoh told them his dreams, but there was no 
one who could interpret them for Pharaoh. Then the chief butler 
spoke to Pharaoh, saying: “I remember my faults this day. When 
Pharaoh was angry with his servants, and put me in custody in the 
house of the captain of the guard, both me and the chief baker, we 
each had a dream in one night, he and I. Each of us dreamed 
according to the interpretation of his own dream. Now there was a 
young Hebrew man with us there, a servant of the captain of the 
guard. And we told him, and he interpreted our dreams for us; to each 
man he interpreted according to his own dream. And it came to pass, 
just as he interpreted for us, so it happened. He restored me to my 
office, and he hanged him.” Then Pharaoh sent and called Joseph, 
and they brought him quickly out of the dungeon; and he shaved, 
changed his clothing, and came to Pharaoh. And Pharaoh said to 
Joseph, “I have had a dream, and there is no one who can interpret it. 
But I have heard it said of you that you can understand a dream, to 
interpret it.” So Joseph answered Pharaoh, saying, “ It is not in me; 
God will give Pharaoh an answer of peace.” Then Pharaoh said to 
Joseph: “Behold, in my dream I stood on the bank of the river. 
Suddenly seven cows came up out of the river, fine looking and fat; 
and they fed in the meadow. Then behold, seven other cows came up 
after them, poor and very ugly and gaunt, such ugliness as I have 
never seen in all the land of Egypt. And the gaunt and ugly cows ate 
up the first seven, the fat cows. When they had eaten them up, no 
one would have known that they had eaten them, for they were just 
as ugly as at the beginning. So I awoke. Also I saw in my dream, and 

suddenly seven heads came up on one stalk, full and good. Then 
behold, seven heads, withered, thin, and blighted by the east wind, 
sprang up after them. And the thin heads devoured the seven good 
heads. So I told this to the magicians, but there was no one who 
could explain it to me.” Then Joseph said to Pharaoh, “The dreams of 
Pharaoh are one; God has shown Pharaoh what He is about to do: 
The seven good cows are seven years, and the seven good heads 
are seven years; the dreams are one. And the seven thin and ugly 
cows which came up after them are seven years, and the seven 
empty heads blighted by the east wind are seven years of famine. 
This is the thing which I have spoken to Pharaoh. God has shown 
Pharaoh what He is about to do. Indeed seven years of great plenty 
will come throughout all the land of Egypt; but after them seven years 
of famine will arise, and all the plenty will be forgotten in the land of 
Egypt; and the famine will deplete the land. So the plenty will not be 
known in the land because of the famine following, for it will be very 
severe. And the dream was repeated to Pharaoh twice because the 
thing is established by God, and God will shortly bring it to pass. 
“Now therefore, let Pharaoh select a discerning and wise man, and 
set him over the land of Egypt. Let Pharaoh do this, and let him 
appoint officers over the land, to collect one-fifth of the produce of the 
land of Egypt in the seven plentiful years. And let them gather all the 
food of those good years that are coming, and store up grain under 
the authority of Pharaoh, and let them keep food in the cities. Then 
that food shall be as a reserve for the land for the seven years of 
famine which shall be in the land of Egypt, that the land may not 
perish during the famine.” 
 
 

1. God used _________________ to elevate Joseph from the 
misery of prison to the splendor of the Pharoah’s court 
 
a. Joseph had proven himself _______________ to God 

and therefore __________ for service 
 

2. Pharoah’s two dreams had caused him great 
______________ 
 
a. None of the ____________ of Egypt could explain them 

 
b. God used an Israelite ____________ to uncover the 

mysteries of _____________ 
 



3. Joseph was _____ forgotten by the _____________ 
 
a. The cupbearer told Pharoah of Joseph’s _________ and 

________________ to interpret dreams 
 

b. He was ___________ from Prison, cleaned, and 
_____________, as was the Egyptian custom 

 
c. He declared the interpretation was from God 

___________ 
 
d. He _______________ this conviction by establishing 

what ____________ was about to do through all the lands 
 

4. Both dreams _____________ seven years of ____________ 
and seven years of _____________ 

 
5. Everything came in ___________ 

 
a. Joseph explained that two __________ of the dream 

signified it was from God and going to happen _________ 
 
b. Joseph had his own ______________________ 
 
c. Joseph had been _________________ twice 
 
d. The _________ dreamers in _______________ 
 
e. Now Pharoah’s ____________________ 

 
6. God’s ______________required and __________________ a 

response 
 
a. Joseph _________________ Pharoah to choose a wise 

man who would oversee storing of the_______________ 
 

b. Wise literature, (_______________________), teaches 
us that _______________ planning ahead is a basic 
principle of ______________________ 
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